

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2023 23A Aggregate Bid Tabulations
February 17, 2023

DESCRIPTION	TEAM ELMERS		MDC CONTRACTING	RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION CO.	POQUETTE LEASING CO.
	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton			
0 to 5,000 Ton of 23A Agg. At Contractor Specified Owned/Leased Location	\$8.77	\$9.45	\$9.50	\$9.00	No Bid
Stockpile Location	Hersha Pit	Fall Park Rd.	Ranney Rd. Pit	Hudson Pit	
Deliver 23A Aggregate to Boyne City Garage					
Up to 2,000 Ton 23A Aggregate Delivered Boyne City Garage	\$11.85		\$13.70	\$13.85	No Bid
Deliver Afton to Boyne City Garage					
Up to 500 Ton Afton Stone Delivered Boyne City Garage	\$21.60		No Bid	\$18.45	\$18.99
Deliver 23A Aggregate to Ironton Garage					
Up to 500 Ton 23A Aggregate Delivered Ironton Garage	\$14.37		\$12.75	\$16.85	No Bid
Deliver Afton Stone to Ironton Garage					
Up to 300 Ton Afton Stone Delivered Ironton Garage	\$24.25		No Bid	\$20.00	\$20.33
Contact Name	James Carey	Vince Carpenter	Paul Glotzhober	John Poquette	
Phone Number	(231) 642-1015	(231) 547-6595	(231) 439-5757	(231) 347-8770	
Fax Number	(231) 943-5508	(231) 547-9171	(231) 347-8862	(231) 347-8783	

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2023 Bulk Diesel Fuel Bid Tabulations

February 17, 2023

BLARNEY CASTLE OIL CO.	
APPROXIMATE GALLONS	Premium Treatment Rate (Per Gallon)
52,000 Gallons @ Ironton Garage (FOB)	\$0.025 (Diesel Guard) \$0.05 (Diesel Guard Plus 50 Cetane)
Payment Terms	Net 10 Days
Bidder Notes	
Contact Name	Jackie Chatman
Phone Number	(231) 864-3488 Ext. 138
Fax Number	(231) 864-2303

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2023 Cold Patch Material Bid Tabulations

February 17, 2023

LOCATION	RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION	ACE-SAGINAW PAVING CO.	UNIQUE PAVING MATERIALS, CORP.	EVERETT GOODRICH TRUCKING, INC.
	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton
500 Ton at Boyne City Garage (FOB)	31A Aggregate \$129.00	31A Aggregate \$146.00	31A Aggregate \$147.60	31A Aggregate Alt. Agg. \$120.00
500 Ton at Ironton Garage (FOB)	\$132.00	\$146.00	\$150.00	\$123.50
Oil Type Used	Bit Mat BMP Green	QPR High Performance	UPM® Blend	QPR
Payment Terms	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30
Bidder Notes			Due to unprecedented and volatile increases in raw materials, prices may or may not be firm for the bid duration.	Using Alternate 29A Aggregate
Contact Name	James Pemberton	Nathan Gotts	Sonya Flanagan	Bruce Goodrich
Phone Number	(231) 439-5757	(989) 755-8147	(231) 883-3030	(989) 356-1791
Fax Number	(231) 347-8862	(989) 755-0426	(216) 341-8514	(989) 356-4895

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2023 Culvert Materials Bid Tabulations

February 17, 2023

CULVERT DIAMETER	JENSEN BRIDGE & SUPPLY	ST. REGIS CULVERT
	Price Per Foot	Price Per Foot
12-inch (16 Gauge)	\$8.00	\$8.25
15-inch (16 Gauge)	\$9.66	\$9.90
18-inch (16 Gauge)	\$12.08	\$12.40
18-inch (14 Gauge)	\$14.75	\$14.95
24-inch (16 Gauge)	\$15.55	\$15.20
24-inch (14 Gauge)	\$19.45	\$20.20
36-inch (14 Gauge)	\$29.11	\$30.60
Minimum Load	None	\$8,000.00
Payment Terms	1% - 10 Days; Net 30 Days No Delivery Charge	Net 30 Days Prices firm for 30 days.
Contact Name	Jim Nuttall	Brian Caldwell
Phone Number	(810) 648-3000	(517) 543-3430
Fax Number	(810) 648-3549	(517) 543-2313

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2023 Dust Control Bid Tabulations

February 17, 2023

38 % CALCIUM CHLORIDE			
LOCATION	D & J BOWEN DUST CONTROL Price Per Gallon	LIQUID CALCIUM CHLORIDE Price Per Gallon	MICHIGAN CHLORIDE SALES Price Per Gallon
Continuous Appl. (Boyne City)	-	\$0.79	No Bid
Continuous Appl. (Ironton)	-	\$0.79	No Bid
Beaver Island Cont. Appl.	-	\$1.16	No Bid
Beaver Island Spot Appl.	-	\$1.16	No Bid
26% MINERAL BRINE			
Delivered to Contractor supplied storage tanker at Boyne City & Ironton Garages	\$0.26	-	No Bid
Continuous Appl. (Boyne City)	\$0.32	-	No Bid
Continuous Appl. (Ironton)	\$0.32	-	No Bid
Beaver Island Cont. Appl.	-	-	No Bid
Beaver Island Spot Appl.	-	-	No Bid
Bidder Notes			
Contact Names	Dave Bowen	Rodney Gerard	Karen Histed
Phone Number	(989) 654-4120 or (989) 654-9467	(989) 684-5860	(989) 681-3221
Fax Number		(989) 684-9953	(989) 681-3574

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2023 Bituminous Materials Bid Tabulations

February 17, 2023

DESCRIPTION	BIT-MAT PRODUCTS OF MICHIGAN	MICHIGAN PAVING & MATERIALS COMPANY
	Price Per Gallon	Price Per Gallon
HFRS-2	\$2.65	\$3.18
AE-90	\$2.65	\$3.18
<hr/>		
Minimum Load (Gallons)		3,000 Gallons
Demurrage	2 HRS. Free then \$125/HR.	2 HRS. Free then \$100/HR.
Cost For Returned Loads	1-1/2 outbound freight; Min. \$200	Outboard freight rate per gallon plus 1/2 or minimum \$350
Payment Terms	Net 30 Days	Net 30 Days
Bidder Notes		AMS Seal SP in-lieu of AE 90
Contact Name	Gary Chapman	Russ Milan
Phone Number	(989) 684-0341	(989) 402-5932
Fax Number	(989) 684-1033	(989) 402-5583

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2023 Pavement Marking Bid Tabulations

February 17, 2023

DESCRIPTION	M & M PAVEMENT MARKINGS	P.K. CONTRACTING	MICHIGAN PAVEMENT MARKINGS, LLC.
	Price Per Lin. Ft.		
Waterborne Dry Pavement Markings - 4" White Edgeline	\$0.054	\$0.054	\$0.057
Waterborne Dry Pavement Markings - 6" White Edgeline	\$0.075	\$0.081	\$0.079
Waterborne Dry Pavement Markings - 4" Yellow Centerline	\$0.053	\$0.056	\$0.060
SPECIAL PAVEMENT MARKINGS	PRICE EACH	PRICE EACH	PRICE EACH
Railroad Crossing Symbol (Waterborne)	\$150.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
24" Stop Bar Per Foot (Waterborne)	\$2.50	\$1.70	\$2.00
Bidder Notes			
Contact Name	David Lawler	Doug Kinkema	Shannon Nielsen
Phone Number	(810) 691-7686	(231) 839-4430	(616) 261-3111
Fax Number		(231) 839-4737	(616) 558-0000

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2023 Underbody Scraper & Grader Blade Bid Tabulations

February 17, 2023

DESCRIPTION	NUMBER OF BLADES	TRUCK & TRAILER		SHULTS EQUIPMENT		VALK MANUFACTURING CO.		WEAR PARTS & EQUIPMENT CO.	
		Price Per Blade		Price Per Blade		Price Per Blade		Price Per Blade	
Flame Hardened X-TRA-EDGE Blades									
GB8-2013 or 5/8" - 7/8" x 8" x 72" X-TRA-EDGE Flame Hardened	300	\$164.00	\$160.92	\$153.00*	\$207.88*				
Wing Plow Blades									
X300582 5/8" x 8" 108" CSB	10	\$156.00	\$166.25	\$160.00					
TTWS Hardened Wing Plow Shoe	50	\$195.00	\$156.00						
Front Plow Blades									
Plowshoe - H Single Ear Hardened Plow Shoes	10	\$169.69	\$105.00	No Bid					
BB20321 or 5/8" x 8" x 149" FSE Monroe Blades	2	\$185.00	\$206.55	\$200.00					
Sandvic System 2000 Carbide Tips									
	No. of Tips	Price Per Tip	Total Price	Price Per Tip	Total Price	Price Per Tip	Total Price	Price Per Tip	Total Price
PS 2244-28FS or MT 10105	520	\$8.00	\$4,160.00	\$8.87	\$4,612.40			\$9.32	\$4,414.80
Minimum Load									
Payment Terms			Net 30				Net 30		
Bidder Notes		Price good for 60 days. 5 weeks delivery A.R.O					*Bidding 1" x 8" x 6-FT curved double bevel through-hardened, heat treated grader blades		*Price good for 6 months; Bidding 1"x6" heat treated blades; Black Cat carbide tips
Contact Name		Rory Diamond	Joe Vernon	Max Woodward					Tyler Jones
Phone Number		(231) 549-3500	(989) 875-4570	(717) 766-0711					(303) 287-1966
Fax Number		(231) 549-3555	(989) 875-2922	(717) 795-9830					(303) 288-2204

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2023 Hot Mix Asphalt Material Bid Tabulations

February 17, 2023

DESCRIPTION	PAYNE & DOLAN, INC.	RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION
	Price Per Ton	Price Per Ton
0 - 500 Ton	\$65.00 (4EL) \$69.00 (5EL)	\$65.00 (4E1) \$71.00 (5E1)
Plant Location	Warner Pit, Elmira Township	Hudson Township
Contact Name	Gery Hartman	Mark Wagner
Phone Number	(989) 731-0700	(231) 439-5757
Fax Number	(989) 731-0703	(231) 347-8862